
Elizabeth A. Schrie
Warfordsburg, 61

Elizabeth A. "Betty" Schiiever, 61,
Warfordsburg, died Sunday, Febru
ary 16, 2003, at ManorCare Health
Service, Chambersburg.

She was born June 1, 1941, in
Pittsburgh.

She was raised by Ed, Jessie and
Ethel Sigel, who preceded her in
death.

She retired in 1998 from Southern
Fulton High School cafeteria after
27 years.

She was a member of Zion Luth

eran Church, Buck Valley Road, War
fordsburg, and she attended the
Amaranth Church of the Brethren.

She is survived by her husband,
Paul W Schiiever, whom she mar
ried October 13,1959, in Hancock; a
daughter, Debbie Ann Schiiever of
Warfordsburg; a son, Kenneth
Schriever and wife, Sharon of War
fordsburg; a sister, Shirley Souders,
Warfordsburg and two grandsons:
Joshua and Bradley Schiiever.

Services will be held Thursday,
February 20, at 11:00 a.m., at Grove
Funeral Home, Hancock. Rev. Free
man Snair will officiate. Burial will
be made in Zion Lutheran Cemetery,
Warfordsburg.

The family will receive Wends at
the funeral home Wednesday even
ing, February 19, from 7:00 p.m. to
9:00 p.m! For the convenience of the
family and friends, the funeral home
will be open from 3:00 p.m. to 9:00
p.m. on Wednesday.

The family requests that memo
rial contributions be made to Manor-

Care Health Services, 1070 Stouffer
Ave., Chambersburg, PA 17201.
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